
Ref: THH70

Sant Cugat / Golf
Golf / Sant Cugat del Vallès

€1,850,000

Some of you have been asking us for homes outside
of Barcelona for days, but without going too far. We
have received some properties in this beautiful area of
Sant Cugat and there is something for everyone. The
options are many, the apartment can be delivered
completely renovated or there is also the possibility
that the renovation will be at your expense in case you
want to give it a more personalized touch. The needs
of each moment will make you move forward based
on your priorities, we leave it in your hands.

Among these options there are various properties, a
huge ground floor with a private garden to run and
run, a first floor that is also very spacious with a
terrace of almost 100m² and finally a small house with
infinite possibilities. The community area is a delight, it
has a swimming pool and lots of green area. Do not
hesitate to contact us to request any type of
information!

You will love it!
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Ref: THH70

• 287 m²
• 4 Bedrooms
• 4 Bathrooms
• Pool
• Mountain views
• Lift
• Fireplace
• Security
• Parking
• Terrace
• Balcony
• Outside

About Golf
Golf-Can Trabal is an exclusive neighborhood
located in Sant Cugat del Vallès, known for its
tranquil environment and stunning natural views. This
residential area is characterized by its extensive green
spaces, golf courses, and modern architecture that
includes elegant houses in Golf-Can Trabal, perfect
for families seeking comfort and quality of life. The
proximity to nature and sports facilities allows for
outdoor activities, while its privileged location provides
easy access to the city of Barcelona. The
neighborhood also features local services, such as
schools and shops, making it an ideal place to live,
combining tranquility with the convenience of urban
life.
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About us
The Home Hunter is a real estate business with more
than 10 years of experience and with the best
properties in Barcelona, Madrid, Empordà and
Andorra. We understand and sell with warm and
transparency, offering a different, honest and close
experience. Our vision has turned us into one of the
territory’s most recognised brands, we are the leaders
on Instagram. Follow us on @thehomehunter_

We are not a typical real estate business, we want to
add value to the process, accompanying our client in
a complete experience, where you can buy, remodel,
decorate and sell with the same people. We are much
more than a real estate business. We are a committed
team, made up of talented people passionate about
finding homes for every story. People that do
everything that is possible to help you live the way you
dream to. We make the real estate business feel
pleasurable and efficient.
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